
To: Bella Klein
From: Lesley Gro 
Sent Wed 12/13/2017 9:32:13 PM 
Subject: Fwd: Invoice from Dr. Fisch 

Please pay the amount on the invoice and not the `verbal' amount I gave below...Dr. Fisch had it 
wrong when he told me...the invoice states different! 

• 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "jeffrey E." leevacatiOnaqn ail com> 
Subject: Re: Invoice from Dr. Fisch 
Date: December 13. 2017 at 4 18 24 PM EST 
To: Lesley Groff 

Ok 

On Wed, Dec 13, 2017 at 3:48 PM Lesley Groff wrote: 

Dr. Fisch is requesting $2850 for an invoice he has ...I believe for a friend of 
yours...Please advise if OK to pay 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
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