
To: Natalia Molotkova 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent: 41 PMi 
Subject: Re: 

 

Let me get permission! Thx 

Sent from my iPhonc 

On Dec 14, 2017, at 3:02 PM, Natalia Molotkova e > wrote: 

We have credit with with Delta of $246.42 , we can use it for new ticket: 
DL 2459 20DEC LGA PEI 0835A 1159A 

TOTAL FARE - USD 274.90 

So, add collect will be 228.48 (28.48 difference in fare, and 200.00 change fee). 
New ticket will remain non refundable with $200.00 change fee. 
OK to issue? 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 
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