
To: 
From: 
Sent: Fri 12/29/2017 7:12:25 PM 
Subject: Re: Do we have a ticket for —to go back to Paris from NY hanging out? 

Ok. Thanks 

Sent from my iPhonc 

On Dec 29, 2017, at 1:52 PM, Natalia Molotkova wrote: 

We actually have another credit with Delta, fro her cancelled flight from Cancun. But I am 
afraid we can use it only to travel from Mexico to US, may be not, I always can try. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

I can do Americans? Or Air France? 
AA refundable one way is $3793.10, AF - $3077.10. AF? 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Hmm. Thank did!? Please book flight from Miami to Paris on Jan 2. Thanks 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 29, 2017, at 1:40 PM, Natalia Molotkova 
wrote: 

please respond: to Paris from Miami or JFK? 
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Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

To Paris from Miami or NYC? 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

If we issue today, it can be voided only by Monday (I am off Monday) 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

and thank you for record locator.. 

On Dec 29. 2017, at 12:04 PM. Natalia Molotkova 
wrote: 

make it so you can void it easily...! perhaps do for Jan. 4 so you can void Jan. 2 or 3 with 
ease? 

On Dec 29, 2017, at 12:04 PM, Natalia Molotkova 
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wrote: 

Record locator is GRETJX. Credit will expire November 4 2018. 
What date return to make from Miami to Paris? Same when she lands from Cuncun? 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

does this ticket have value though? do I need to do something with this?it's expired right? I 
don't see the Record Locator on it...trying to figure out... 

On Dec 29, 2017, at 9:40 AM, Natalia Molotkova 
wrote: 

OK 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

she will fly with Jeffrey to JFK around Jan. 4... 

• 'a Molotkova 
wrote: 

yes, !! lets do that please. 
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she may fly with Jeffrey to Paris from NY around Jan. 20, but it would probably be easier if 
she had a real ticket to show them...thank you!! 

On Dec 29. 2017, at 11:49 AM. Natalia Molotkova 
rote: 

Do you want me to book her from Miami to Paris? Issue ticket as refundable? And cancel 
when she is back to JFK? OR she is going to Paris right after? 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

So with this open ticket...we never changed it, but can do so now? She is saying it is better 
to have a ticket showing she will go back to Paris when she comes through customs from 
Cancun into Miami on Jan. 2... 

On Dec 29, 2017, at 9:40 AM, Natalia Molotkova 
wrote: 

Forne still have following unused tickets: 
ELECTRONIC TICKET RECORD 

TKT:0067022997919 ISSUED:10NOV17 
NAME 

CPN FLT CLS DATE BRDOFF TIME ST F/B STAT 
1 DL 1014 X 24NOV JFKCDG 930P OK XLHX46M4/APZE OPEN 
2 DL 405 V 10DEC CDGJFK 1025A OK VLHX46M4/APZE OPEN 

FARE USD204.00 TAX 300.OOYR TAX 36.00US TAX 5.50YC 
TAX 7.00XY TAX 3.96XA TAX 5.60AY 
TAX 24.10FR TAX 32.40QX TAX 5.201Z 
TAX 4.50XF 

TOTAL USD628.26 

Can be used from NYC to anywhere else. 
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Also she has flights booked: 
DL 405 15FEB CDG JFK 1025A 115P 
DL 404 15MAR JFK CDG 650P 725A 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Flours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

I know we have the ticket we just changed for but do we have 
any ticket hanging out for her to go from NY back to Paris? I don't think we do...I think we 
only have her coming back from Cancun to Miami on Rec. Loc# . .but do you see 
anything else? She is going to need to go back to Paris soon I think...

You can check on this after the Canada stuff!! :) not a rush...but I am being asked and I 
don't see anything at first glance 
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