
To: 
Cc: 
From: 
Sent 
Subject Re: Luggage 

Sat 12/9/2017 5:33:04 AM 

I've t the envelope. Thank you! 

On 8 Dec 2017, at 14:39, ••: > wrote: 

Hello all! 
I'll leave the envelope for at the dorman in 2 hours. 

please let me know once you get it 0 

On Fri, Dec 8, 2017 at 2:33 PM Lesley Groff wrote: 

Jeffrey has asked that 
...unfortunately we can not pre pay for your luggage. You can olio 

when you check in (either on line or at the a. rt 
HI 

bring you $100 cash to pay for your bags.. is cc'd here...she also lives at 
the apartments...I know you are moving to ...can you please coordinate with 
her to get your money? 

Thanks, Lesley 
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