To:  Lesiey cror

From: Bella Klein
Sent: Thur 12/21/2017 6:28:23 PM
Subject: Re: Receipt From Frederic Fekkal - 5th Avenue

ok
Thank you,
Bella

On Dec 21, 2017, at 1:27 PM, Lesley ('_'-rnﬁ‘_ wrote:

yes, it is for me but it is wrong..I have asked them to correct it.. still waiting for them to
send invoice. Will forward to you once | have it. They overcharged for stuff |
didn't do.

On Dec 21, 2017, at 1:20 PM, Bella Klem
Wrote:

same day [ have another charge, do vou have an idea who 1s it for

DEC20 FREDERIC FEKKAI SALON Jeffrey E Epstein $585 20Alert Me When Po;

Doing business as
FREDERIC FEKKAI SALON
View Details on Merchant Website
712 5TH AVE

FRMT 1

MEW YORK

MY

10019

UNITED STATES
212.753.9500

Thank vou,
Bella

On Dec 21, 2017, at 10:41 AM, Lesley Groff
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Begin forwarded message:

ubject: Receipt From Frederic

Fekkai - 5th Avenue
Date: December 20, 2017 at 7:54:05
PM

<Invoice201712208764.PDF=> -
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