
To: Bella Klein 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent Wed 12/20/2017 5:47:19 PM 
Subject: Re: Can you help me? 

Very very bottom of mail I think 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 20, 2017, at 12:42 PM, Bella Klein wrote: 

Where is the forms, i don't have the attachment 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

On Dec 20, 2017, at 12:41 PM, Lesley Groff ‹ > 
wrote: 

Greatly appreciate it 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 20, 2017, at 12:39 PM, Bella Klein <II > wrote: 

ok 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

On Dec 20 2017 at 12:37 PM, Lesley Groff 
wrote: 

I need 3rd party credit card authorization form filled out so 
can stay in a hotel in 

Cancun. I am on a train and cannot fill out 
this form's would you mind filling out the 
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forms and send them back to Natasha? I will 
send in my next email to you. Would greatly 
appreciate it. The girls arc going on the 23rd 
December!! 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "jeffrey E." 
leevacation@amail.com>

Date: December 20.2017 at 12:33:49 PM EST 
To: Lesley Groff 
Subject: Re: Hotel for the 

Ok 

On Wed, Dec 20, 2017 at 1:22 PM Lesley Groff 
wrote: 

Hotel has been a bit tricky. The 
one below did not allow 3rd 
party credit cards. Tried several 
others and same issue or very 
expensive or couples only!!. I 
had Natasha go back to 
Paradisus (the first hotel) and 
request better price. We got 
them all inclusive for $6460. 
They allow 3rd party CC's. 
Will fill out credit card 
authorization form and fax 
toda to confirm hotel FYI e 
the !!. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 20, 2017, at 10:23 AM, jeffrey E. 
leevacation@gmail.com>
wrote: 

Ok 
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On Wed, Dec 20, 2017 at 10:43 AM Lesle Groff 

wrote: 

The price for the 
Paradisus has 
gone up today to 
$7220 total 
...yesterday it 
was $5849 . 
Below hotel is 
similar in price 
and looks nice. 
Will book this 
instead of the 
Paradisus! (I 
tried to book 
Paradisus last 
night, but by the 
time we made 
decision our 
Amex rep, 
Natasha, was 
gone for the 
day...no other 
Amex rep could 
provide us the 
same 
price...Natasha 
had rec'd a 
special price from 
'her 
partner'...partner 
can't give the 
same rate 
today...) 
BOOKING 
BELOW 
HOTEL: 
THE ROYAL 
SANDS r 

" 413.53 

All inclusive 
https://royalresery 
ations.com/resorts 
/the-royal-sands 
ALL INCLUSIVE 

EFF 23DEC - 25DEC 
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493.23 
591.31 
619.47 
681.42 
639.66 

EFF 25DEC - 26DEC 
EFF 26DEC - 27DEC 
EFF 27DEC - 29DEC 
EFF 29DEC - 30DEC 
EFF 30DEC - 31DEC 

553.81 EFF 31DEC - 01JAN 
423.76 EFF 01JAN - 03JAN 

APPROX. TOTAL PRICE 5872.97 USD 
INCLUDES TAXES AND SURCHARGES 

OV 2 BDS 1 BTR 
AA 2DBL BEDS 1 BATH AND SMALL BALCONY 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to kin, acation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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