
To: 
From: 
Sent Mon 12/18/2017 6:05:45 PM 
Subject: Re: Orthodontist 

My goodness!!! Thank you so much!!! 

Ern, 18 xteK. 2017 r. a 13:03, Lesley Groff 

done! all paid ... 

> On Dec 18, 2017, at 12:01 PM, . wrote: 

> Dear Lesley, 
> Jeffrey told to me to schedule my orthodontist's appointment asap and that he will take care of 

the bill. 
> I've scheduled my appointment on Friday, December 22nd at 930 AM and spoke to the 

representative who told that the payment needs to be done on the day of my visit or before. 
Since I'm not the one who's paying, to avoid any miscommunication, could you please give 
them a call at and provide with the card information? Please let me know. 

> Thank you so much! 

> Appointment details: 
> Invisalign treatment 
> Fri Dec 22nd 930 AM 

> rE M3 
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