To: Bella Klein
From: Lesley Groff
Sent: Maon 121182017 6:45:47 PM

Subject: Re: Orthodontist

| called and paid. sent you copy of invoice already!

On Dec 18, 2017, at 1:45 PM, Bella Kicin <|||| | G- o

Am | calling or you?
Thank you,

Bella
Tel:
On Dec 18, 2017, at 1:05 PM, Lesley Gmf’f*i_‘-*
wrote:
Begin forwarded message:
From: "jeffrey E." <|eevacation@gmail.com=
Subject: Re: Orthodontist
Date: December 18, 2017 at 12:38:26 PM EST
To: Lesley Groff <[
Yes
On Mon, Dec 18, 2017 at 12:07 PM Lesley Gmﬂ'ﬁ_*

wrote:
Ok to pay ?
Sent from my iPhone
Begin forwarded message:

From:'

Date: December 18, 2017 at 12:01:24 PM EST
To: Lesley Groff < NN
Subject: Orthodontist
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Dear Lesley,

Jeffrey told to me to schedule my orthodontist's appointment asap and
that he will take care of the bill.

I've scheduled my appointment on Friday, December 22nd at 930 AM
and spoke to the representative who told
that the payment needs to be done on the
day of my visit or before. Since I'm not the
one who's paying, to avoid any
miscommunication, could you please give
them a call at ‘and provide with
the card information? Please let me know.

Thank you so much!

Appomntment details:
Invisalign treatment
Fri. Dec 22nd. 930 AM

DOB

please note
The mformation contamed n this commumication 15
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute mside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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