
To: 
From: Bella Klein 
Sent Wed 12/13/2017 8:38:13 PM 
Subject: Re: I owe you money... 

ok 
Thank you, 
Bella 

> On Dec 13, 2017, at 2:58 PM, wrote: 

> sending you check! We do not need to purchase seats... 

>> On Dec 8, 2017, at 3:32 PM, Bella Klein wrote: 

>> You can send it at any time, but please make sure that all charges included: 
seats, airport charges, etc.. no rush to reimburse 
» Thank you, 
» Bella 

>>> on Dec 8, 2017, at 3:27 PM, wrote: 
>» 
>» Hi Bella..I have purchased tickets for my family's trip in February on JE's 
amex (just easier since I am constantly on with Amex and they are very 
helpful!)-I will send you a check to cover the price tags-when is best for me to 
send to you? Tickets are being issued today.. 
>» 
>>> Rec. Loci's DYFBVP AND NZTIVG 
>» 
>>> Total is $1978.93 
>» 
>» 
>> 
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