
To: 
From: 
Sent: 
Subject: 

Natalia Molotkova 
Thur 12/14/2017 10:26:31 PM 
Airplane tickets 21.12.17 

Title: American Express 

Thank you!! 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

GREAT! please issue ticket for 
9049 for transfers... 

On t 5:12 PM Natalia Molotkova 
< > wrote: 

Your response is required to complete this reservation. Prices and availability are subject to 
change. 
• Total air reservation, including taxes and fees: $1702.30. 
• EUR70.00 change penalty plus difference in fare. Refundable; refund fee EUR70.00 

• Outbound -
Aeroflot SU2383, business, 21DEC from Geneva GVA to Moscow 940P 305A 22DEC 
Aeroflot SU1410, business 22DEC from Moscow SVO to Ekaterinburg SVX 650A 1120A 

• Inbound - 
Aroflot SU1411, business, 06JAN from Ekaterinburg SVX to Moscow SVO 1220P 1250P 
Aeroflot SU2760, business 06JAN from Moscow SVO to Geneva GVA 220P 400P 
Please reply to this email and provide your authorization to proceed. 

Will need CID number for transfer. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 
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Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

OK 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

We also must purchase her transfer with Blacklane to Geneva airport on 21st and from Geneva 
airport back to school on Jan.6 lease...her school address again is: 

Thank you'll!' 

On Dec 14 2017 at 4:43 PM Natalia Molotkova 
> wrote: 

ha...lucky for her then! Please issue the Biz Round Trip ticket! thanks 

On Dec 14 2017 at 4:43 PM Natalia Molotkova 
> wrote: 

It is sold out in coach on return. If I put her on outbound in coach, fare is $1729.40, business round 
trip $1702.30. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 
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Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

has class until 4pm, so she must take a late flight...if the flight she sent over is only option, 
than we purchase it in COACH...(or are you saying biz is cheapest?) but please do let me know if 
there is a later flight at a lower fare...thanks 

On t 3:25 PM Natalia Molotkova 
wrote: 

Flights she emailed, on my end lowest fare is in business: 
1 SU 2383 21DEC GVA SVO 0940P 0305A 
1 SU 1410 22DEC SVO SVX 0650A 1120A 

2 SU 
2 SU 

1411 06JAN SVX SVO 1220P 1250P 
2760 06JAN SVO GVA 0220P 0400P 

TOTAL FARE - USD 1702.30 

Lowest coach on the market is: 

1 AY 1532 21DEC GVA HEL 1050A 0255P 
OPERATED BY NORDIC REGIONAL AIRLINES 
1 AY 725 21DEC HEL SVX 1145P 0545A 
OPERATED BY NORDIC REGIONAL AIRLINES 

2 AY 
2 AY 

726 06JAN SVX HEL 0640A 0650A 
1531 06JAN HEL GVA 0730A 0935A 

TOTAL FARE - USD 1191.50 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Jeffrey is asking if we can find a cheaper ticket than this. Let me know please! 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 
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From: =la 
Dat • m 7 at 2:39:51 PM EST 
To: 
Subject: Airplane tickets 21.12.17 

Hey Lesley! How are you? 

I was wondering if you could book tickets for me. There's going to be a Christmas break at 
school, so I will go to Russia for a bit. 

The prefect ticket would be this one: 

Thank you! 

To learn more about e-mail security or report a suspicious email. please visit us at amencanexpress comfpla. 
C' 2015 American Express All rights reserved . 
American Express uses 3rd party concierge service providers who are not authorized to act on behalf of American Express \ 
and you acknowledge that Amoncan Express is in no way responsible or liable for the actions of the service provider and the • 
only remedy for any claims relating to services or products provided by the service provider is against the service provider and 
not against American Express. You are responsible for any purchases. shipping charges and/or foes you authorize. We 
reserve the right to note profile and preference data for servicing purposes. 
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