
To: Lesley Groff[ 
From: Bella Klein 
Sent: Mon 1/8/2018 6:26:14 PM 
Subject: Re: Did I cash my reimbursement Checks? 

no problem:)) 
Thank you, 
Bella 

> On Jan 8, 2018, at 12:33 PM, Lesley Groff < wrote: 

> awesome! thank you my friend! 

>> On Jan 8, 2018, at 12:28 PM, Bella Klein 1 > wrote: 

>> • both cashed 
» Thank you, 
» Bella 

>> 
>» On Jan 8, 2018, at 11:02 AM, Lesley Groff < > wrote:
>» 
>>> Sorry to bother you Bella! But when you have a moment, can you see if I 
cashed my reimbursement checks? You sent them to me in the mail... 
>>> 
>» Nov. 14- Check for $440.49 
>» Nov. 13- Check I! for $568.64 
>» 
>» It's been too long and I don't recall receiving them in the mail? But maybe 
I did!@! 
>>> I have more reimbursements to give you this week... 
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