To: Bella Klei

From:

Sent: Tue 1/8/2018 3:48:33 PM

Subject: Re: Reimbursement for [Jilf-Can you Give to Rich to bring over at 11:30am today?

Thanks

Sent from my iPhone

On Jan 9. 2018, at 10:45 AM. Bella Klem ~'i_> wrote:

gave check to Rich
Thank you,
Bella

On Jan 9, 2018, a¢ 10:40 v [

wrote:

Yikes! so sorry...I must not have cleared out the calculator!? You are correct at
Reimbursement of 5481.95!!

2 AM, Bella Klein

On Jan 9, 2018, at 10:3
= = wWrote:

Math doesnt work, 1 have only 481.95, please let me know
Thank you,
Bella

On Jan 9, 2018, at 10:06 AM, _
- o

Hi Bella. Attached are my reimbursements. . .can you give to Rich as
he has an appointment with JE today at
11:30am...
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Total- $633.40
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