
To: LAVAAN 
From: 
Sent Wed 1/17/2018 4:31:26 PM 
Subject Re: LAVAAN Credit Card Authorization form 

Super! thank you 

On Jan 17, 2018, at 11:30 AM, LAVAAN wrote: 

Hi Lesley, 
Thank you for emanne the credit card authorization form. Attached you will find the 

receipt for cleaning for today. 
If you have any questions or concerns, kindly respond to this email or give me a call at 

212.837.1833. 

Best, 
Brittany 

On Wed, Jan 17, 2018 at 10:33 AM, > wrote: 

On Jan 17, 2018, at 10:10 AM, LAVAAN 
wrote: 

Hi 
Please have Jeffrey fill out the credit card authorization form attached, scan and 

email to us for efa= cleaning. 

Best, 
Brittany 

LAVAAN 

wvov.lavaansmile.com 
<Credit Card Payment Authorization.docx> 

LAVAAN 
Smile Like You Mean It 
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