From:
Sent: Wed 1172018 12:20:15 AM

Subject: Re: Reminder to return Vince Camuto Women&apos:s Bendra...

God Gracious |, I thought we lost 1t , thank you

Carluz & Arline Tovlo

On Jan 16, 2018, at IW]S,_* wrote:

FYI! I have my credit ! thanks

On Jan 12, 2018 at 12:53 PM, CARLUZ TOYLO

Attached is a receipts from UPS for the Boots that was returned Last Dec.04 |
2017, Thank you

Carluz Tovlo

On Jan 08, 2018, at 03:35 PM, Lesley Groff <lesley jee(@gmail com™> wrote:

ok...I thought so!
thanks!
Lesley

On Jan 8, 2018, at 3:34 PM, CARLUZ
TOYLO < = wrote:

Yes we did last month , I will find you the receipts .

Carluz & Arline Tovlo

On Jan 8, 2018, at IS:H,_ wrote:
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Hi Renato and Carluz....did you
send back the boots to Amazon
that Lasma wanted to return? |
am receiving an email stating
they stll await the return?

Begin forwarded
message:

From: lesley

Subject: Fw:
Reminder to
return Vince
Camuto
Womené&apos;s
Bendra...

Date: January 8,
2018 at 3:29:10
PM

Sent: Monday, January 8, 2018 3;

To:

Subject: Reminder to return Vince Camuto Women&apos;s
Bendra...

Hello |

Return Reminde
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This is a reminder to return the item below. We've issued your refund in
advance, but still expect to receive the return. Send the item back by Thu, J:
18 to avoid being charged again. Please Contact-Us to get a new return lab

Send by:
Thu, Jan 18

Vince Camuto Women's Bendra...

ltem subtotal: $198.00

Tax: $0.00
Total: $198.00

Your original payment method will be charged $198.00 if you don't
send the item back by Thu, Jan 18.

This email was sent from a nolification-only address that cannot accept incoming
email. Please do not reply to this message.

.--MuLtIpArT_BoUnDaRy--

<120417LasmaBootsreturned pdf>
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