
To: Amex Centurian Travel 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent: Mon 1/22/2018 11:07:08 PM 
Subject: Re: Change Anna Leibiba's Flight from tomorro w to wed! 

I just got it!! All good! 

On Jan 22, 2018, at 6:04 PM, Natalia Molotkova 
> wrote: 

It is done, let me email it again. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

I still don't have it (?) 

On Jan 22, 2018, at 5:55 PM, Natalia Molotkova  P- wrote: 

You should have it by now. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Let me call ticketing. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Hi Natasha. Can you check on the ticket please? I don't have it and it's late in Paris already. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jan 22, 2018, at 1:45 PM, Natalia Molotkova ‹ > wrote: 

Please issue this ticket 
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Sent from my iPhone 

On Jan 22, 2018, at 1:45 PM, Natalia Molotkova <  wrote: 

Your response is required to complete this reservation. Prices and availability are subject to change. 
• Total air reservation, including taxes and fees: $86.00. 
• Non-refundable, EUR70.00 change penalty plus difference in fare. 
• Code share: OPERATED BY ROSSIYA AIRLINES 
• Inbound - Aeroflot, OPERATED BY ROSSIYA AIRLINES 

Coach. 24JAN, Wednesday, from Paris CDG to St. Petersburg LED 1240P 555P 
Please reply to this email and provide your authorization to proceed. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Great. Please issue the change. Thanks 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jan 22, 2018, at 1:30 PM, Natalia Molotkova > wrote: 

Will be 86.00USD add collect. 
24JAN CDG LED 1240P 555P 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

OK. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Mana er 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Wed January 24!! Sorry for earlier mistake on date! Wed is the 25th not 23rd. 

Hi Natasha. We need to move Anna's Flight to wed Jan 24!! You can do same Flight if available 
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12:40pm Anna Leibina to depart Paris CDG via Aeroflot#6636 (Rec. Loc# 

Sent from my iPhone 

Pnvacy Statement I Visit the Centurion Card w,bsite 
To learn more about e-mail security or report a suspicious e-mail. please visit us at 

2015 American Express. All rights reserved 
American Express uses 3rd party concierge service providers who are not authorized to act on behalf of American Express and you acknowledge that Amor 
way responsible or liable for the actions of the service provider and the only remedy for any claims relating to services or products provided by the service pr 
service provider and not against American Express. You are responsible for any purchases. shipping charges andlor foes you authorize. We reserve the rigt 
preference data for servicing purposes. 

EFTA_R1_00996261 
EFTA02235589


