To: Bella Klein

From: Lesley Groff

Sent: Maon 2/5/2018 3:17:15 PM
Subject: Re: Peertransfer

Flywire is the website | used to pay for the school in London.. .1 sent you all he backup when |
didit.. rgh” [

On Feb 5, 2018, at 9:59 AM, Bella Klein <} N ' ote:

Les,

Please forward backup
Thank you,

Bella

Tel:

a Molotkova
= WTOte:

On Feb 5, 2018, at 9:55 AM, Natah

Lesley emailed, that she knew what it was
Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova
Centurion Relationship Manager
@

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

Good Morning Natasha
Just a reminder for backup on charge from

Peertransfer Spain

Thank you,
Bella

Tel:

On Feb 1, 2018, at 3:10 PM, Natalia Molotkova _:= wrote:
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Thank you!!
Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationshii Manaier

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

| know what that is!!! Bella, | will get back to you. Thank you MNatasha...

On Feb 1, 2018, at 2:51 PM, Natalia Molotkova _:= wrote:

It is not one of the tickets | issued.

said doing business as Flywire, which is a payment system.
Regards,

Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relation Shii han aier

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

Let me have a look,
Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relation Shii han aier

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

| do not know what that is?!
We had fly from Riga to Budapest on 12/30/2017...(Rec. Loc|j D) that is all |

> On Feb 1, 2018, at 12:04 PM, Bella Klein _b wrote:

>

> Les/Natasha,
> Please help to find backup for charge on 12/30/17 from Peertransfer Spain $1300

-

> Thank you,
> Bella

>
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= Tel:
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