
To: comj 
From: 
Sent Mon 1/22/2018 1:49:57 PM 
Subject: Re: 

Thank you so much, Lesley!!! 
So sorry to disturb you! 

On Jan 22, 2018, at 8:48 AM, Lesley Groff ‹ > wrote: 

It's actually called Jeffrey has paid for 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jan 22, 2018, at 8:40 AM, wrote: 

Ok, let me know. 
I'm not sure, I remember that it was a mistake when we were with 

and J wrote me yesterday that for it has to be 
» I don't know what and where is it.. 

Thank you! 
Looking forward to further information 

On Mon, Jan 22, 2018 at 8:37 AM Lesley Groff cr > wrote: 

Ok. Hang on ... 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jan 22, 2018, at 7:30 AM, 
wrote: 

Good morning Lesley ! 
I think it was a mistake when we went with . We 
need another 

On Mon, Jan 22, 2018 at 7:18 AM Lesley Groff a 
wrote: 

Hi 
We will get in to see this morning! Don't 
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• The same doctor you went to recently with 
...the address is: 

Lesley 

> On Jan 21, 2018, at 10:09
wrote: 

> Good evening, Lesley! 

> Sorry to disturb you so late. Thank you very much for the ticket-
organization for the show! We finally saw it tonight and 
it was so nice!!! 

> I appreciate very much your help! And I apologize for the mess that we had 
last time 

> J asked, can you please  the a t with 
)) for as soon as possible :) 

> Thank you very much! 
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