From: omas Costello

Sent: Mon 2M12/2018 2:10:33 PM
Subject: Re: January Invoice

Hcﬂo-

Lets do Wednesday. They will be there in the morning.

Thomas Costello

On Mon, Feb 12, 2018 at 8:00 AM, wrote:

Please advise when you can come take down the christmas hghts. . 1 want to have the tubs
available to your men...would prefer a day its not raining so they are not putting away wet
lights ;)

thanks!
On Feb 8. 2018, at 4:00 PM. Thomas Costello ,,_
wrote:
Hello,

Attached is your January invoice and statement from Thomas J. Costello Landscaping.

Thank you.

Thomas J. Costello Landscaping LLC
P.O. Box 17304
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Thomas J. Costello Landscaping LLC
P.O. Box 17304
Stamford, CT 06907
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