
To: Bella Klein 
From: 
Sent Wed 2/14/2018 4:34:12 PM 
Subject: Re: JE amex 

yes, those were the slippers I purchased for Kathy Ruenunler...1 am positive I sent you the emails 
for them...? let me have a look again... 

On Feb 14, 2018, at 11:09 AM, Bella Klein •c > wrote: 

Can you help with JE charge 
01/30/2018 store.rogcrvivicr.com - New York 1,344.61 

Thank you, 
Bella 
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