o
From: icha ahn

Sent: Tue 3/13/2018 7:06:55 PM
Subject: Fwd: Invoice for Terje ($4275.00)

sorry to be pain but these jpeg cannot be increased i size and then printed clearly as they are

coming in very small
can you please send as PDF
thanks

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel

fa

cell

Begin forwarded message:

From:
Subject: Invoice for Terje I

Date: March 13, 2018 at 2:49:45 PM EDT

To: Rich Kahn |

EFTA_R1_01004199
EFTA02238164



