
To: Lesley Groff[ 
From: Bella Klein 
Sent: Tue 2/27/2018 12:49:07 PM 
Subject: Re: Funds Received for Refund 

Refund for 

Thank you, 
Bella 

On Fcb 27, 2018, at 7:30 AM, Lesley Groff wrote: 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Jose Luis Iranzo 
Subject: Funds Received for Refund 
Date: February 27, 2018 at 6 58 17 AM EST 
To: ' 

Dear Jeffrey Epstein, 

Thank you for placing your trust in Flywire. We appreciate your business. 

We are happy to inform you that we have received the funds for the refund 
of your payment Ira from St Giles International. We will now 

process the payment back to the account/card that the funds originated 
from. 

Please note that this may take a few days. We will send you an email 
notifying you when the refund has been completed. 

If you previously received an email from us requesting more 
information to complete your refund and have not yet responded, 

please reply as soon as possible. If you did not receive an email, no 
further action is required from you. 

Do not hesitate to reach out if you have any questions. We're always happy 
to help. 

Best regards, 

EFTA_R1_01004990 

EFTA02238462



Payment Support 
Flywire 

141 Tremont Street 9th Floor 
Boston. MA 02111 

USA 
Customer Hotlines 

US toll freer I US local number -
Click n, n_rq for other international numbers 

"• Confidentiality Warning "• This message (including any attachments) is confidential and may be privileged. If you have 
received it by mistake please notify the sender by return o-mail and delete this message from your system. Any unauthorized 

use or dissemination of this message in whole or in part is strictly prohibited. 
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