
To: Lesley Groffellnil 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent Tue 3/13/2018 7:32:34 PM 
Subject Re: Fisch invoice-did this work? 

no unfortunately not 
take picture of bill with iPhone then send via PDF - that should work.. 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

On Mar 13, 2018, at 3:17 PM, Lesley Groff wrote: 

<FischInvoice.pdf> 
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