
To: Rich Kahn 
From: 
Sent: 
Subject: Re: Dr Fisch Invoice for Terje 

Tue 3/13/2018 7:51:39 PM 

good deal! 
He texted it to me... 

> On Mar 13, 2018, at 3:46 PM, Richard Kahn <  wrote: 

> • best version and will work 
> thanks 

> Richard Kahn 
> HBRK Associates Inc. 
> 575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
> New York, NY 10022 
> tel 212-971-1306 
> fax 212-320-0381 
> cell 917-414-7584 

» On Mar 13, 2018, at 3:37 PM, wrote: 

» <IMG_0672.JPG> 
>> 

» Sent from my iPhone 
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