
To: Diana Molina 
From: 
Sent Fri 2/16/2018 5:10:23 PM 
Subject Re: LightStim Invoice 19221 - Jeffery Epstein 

Received the LED light and have already assembled! thank you for your help! 

On Feb 15, 2018, at 1:54 PM, Diana Molina < E> wrote: 

Hello 

Please see the attached invoice and receipt below. Tracking will be sent to you by FedEx. 
Thank you for your business! 

<Inv_19221_from_LightStim_8012.pdf> 

<Transaction Receipt.pdf> 
Diana Molina 
Business Coordinator, Finance Department 

Office (949) 502-4088 
Fax (949) 534-0207 

16552 Von Kerman Ave 
www.LightStim,com Irvine. CA 92606 

The information contained in this electronic mail transmission is 
confidential and intended to be sent only to the stated recipient of the 
transmission. Any use is prohibited and will be of no effect. 
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