
To 
Cc: 
From: 
Sent 
Subject: 

Lesley Groff 
Thur 3/8/2018 9:20:52 PM 
Re: Receipts for Duvet, Comforter and sheets please! 

I did not! 

On Mar 8, 2018, at 4:10 PM, Bella Klein <bklein575@gmail.com> wrote: 

> • Lesley, 
> Did you 
missed 
> Thank you, 
> Bella 

» On Mar 5, 2018, at 

IlF...please forward 
purchased for Ehud to 

received receipts from III, as I didn't , please resend if i 

2:57 PM, Lesley Groff > wrote: 

the receipt for the duvet, comforter and sheets you 
Bella as soon as possible!! thanks..Lesley 
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