
To: IMMO 
From: 
Sent Fri 3/9/2018 IMO 2 PM 
Subject: Re: Flight for= 

Sony my mistake return 10th of March 

Envoye de mon iPhone 

Le 9 mars 2018 a 18:33, Lesley Groff ‹ > a ocrit 

M. will you purchase the ticket for-? 
(This flight attached is for March 17 (?) I thought she was to return on March 10?) 

On Mar 9, 2018, at 11:07 AM, 
wrote: 

<image I .png> 

Envoye de mon iPhone 

Le 9 mars 2018 a 16:49, 

Will do right now Lcs! 

On Fri, Mar 9, 2018 at 10:45 AM Lesley Groff 
wrote: 

a 0ct* 

Hi ...sn you please try to find a less expensive 
flight for M...?? the price these flights from the US 
are too high...Jeffrey requesting your help...please let 
me know..thanks, Lesley 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "jeffrey E." 
leevacation ornail.com>
Subject: Re: Flight for 
Date: March 9, 2018 at 10:37:55 AM 
EST 
To:L off 
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have them find an airine ask 

On Fri, Mar 9, 2018 at 4:16 PM, Lesley Groff ‹ > 
wrote: 

Request was for to depart noon on 
Saturday: 

Saturday March 10 depart Aeroflot 260 at II:50am arrive Moscow 
5:30pm. $1212.20 total. (Connecting 
Flight is about $750. Earlier direct flight 
around $1000). Ok to book DIRECT flight 
at 11:50am? Please advise 

Sent from my iPhone 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
WE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmad con), and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
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