
To: 
Cc: 
From: Richard K 
Sent Thur 3/15/2018 2:33:43 PM 
Subject Re: Medical invoice for Terje 

thank you 
Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
Ncw York, NY 10022 

On Mar 15, 2018, at 10:33 AM, wrote: 

Bella! I gave Dr. Fish's office the Amex number...they just called me asking for 
payment....so I gave it to them! 

Richard Kahn 
wrote: 

Jcc approved payment via credit card. Bela please call doctors office tomorrow and 
pay via jee Amex. 
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Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
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