
To: Jeffrey EMeevacation mailcom ; Rich Kahn 
Cc: Karyna Shuliakf 
From: Larry Visoski 
Sent Thur 3/15/2018 4:02:13 PM 
Subject Re: 

Hi Karyna 
My arrival may be later than 2:30 PM today I will keep you posted, Pm told there is still an 
outstanding invoice that Gulfstrcam accounting was charging to the GIV by their error, total is 
$38k 
I am in no rush to leave and will dispute this, I have no idea what the items are„ I should have it 
in my possession in the next 30 minutes and report back„ 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 14, 2018, at 9:25 PM, jeffrey E. tevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

karyan will meet you at 230 . to help move things from g4 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevaeation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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