
To: 
From: 
Sent: 
Subject: Re: $24O0 charge at Dentist? Jeffrey is asking... 

Bella Klein 

ok thanks... 

Thur 3/15/2018 6:51:30 PM 

> On Mar 15, 2018, at 2:45 PM, Bella Klein wrote: 

> <Amex_Black_Magnani_JE_2400_111517.pdf> 
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