
To: 
From: 
Sent: 
Subject: 

Lesley Groff 
Tue 3/27/2018 4:01:55 PM 
Re: Hotel in Milan 

Ok super. Thanks 

Sent from my iPhone 

> On Mar 27, 2018, at 11:49 AM, > wrote:

> Sure . Thank you Lesley 

> Envoye de mon iPhone 

>> Le 27 mars 2018 A 15:50, Lesley Groff < > a ecrit : 
>> 
>> , the hotel in Milan says they have very strict payment policies and do 
not usually accept third party payments through credit card for security 
reasons Can you please put on your credit card, email the receipt to Rich in our 
accounting dept (he is cc'd here) and he can wire the money (like Bella did with 
your last hotel stay)... 

» Lesley 
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