
To: Amex Centurian Trave 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent: Mon 3/26/2018 8:57:24 PM 
Subject: Re: Train Tickets 

YES Please issue this train ticket for for $412 total! thanks 

On Mar 26, 2018, at 4:55 PM, Natalia Molotkova 
rote: 

OK, here it is - total $412. Ok to issue? 
April 5-7 
From LONDON ST-PANCRAS to PARIS NORD - 03:31 PM LONDON ST-PANCRAS 
06:47 PM PARIS NORD 

Eurostar 9036 - Reservation included 

1 x Standard Premier Leisure RT 
Window, Coach 001, Seat 018 

Non Refundable, exchangeable prior to train departure. Exchanges may be subject to a fixed fee of 50 Euro: 
differential when applicable. Exchange allowed for equal or higher value and no refund when price decrease 
returned for exchange. Exchanges can be performed by the issuing office or at any Eurostar station. Refund: 
to a 7% administrative fee from Rail Europe and paper tickets must be returned to the issuing office within th 
procedure, please visit httefiwww.raileurope.com/rail-help/customer-supportrexchanqes-and-refunds-on-a-ti 

From PARIS NORD to LONDON ST-PANCRAS - 04:07 PM PARIS NORD 
05:39 PM LONDON ST-PANCRAS 

Eurostar 9043 - Reservation included 

1 x Standard Premier Leisure RT 
Isolated Window, Coach 014, Seat 021 

Non Refundable, exchangeable prior to train departure. Exchanges may be subject to a fixed fee of 50 Euro.: 
differential when applicable. Exchange allowed for equal or higher value and no refund when price decrease 
returned for exchange. Exchanges can be performed by the issuing office or at any Eurostar station. Refund: 
to a 7% administrative fee from Rail Europe and paper tickets must be returned to the issuing office within th 
procedure, please visit http://www.raileurope.com/rail-help/customer-supportlexchancies-and-refunds-on-a-ti 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

No, 824 was total fro two people, let me release hold for two and do new one. Sorry 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
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Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

For one person got better rate - Premier - $352.00 per one way (I was giving you rates before one way, not r 
$704.00 round trip. Before was 412 per one way, round trip 824.00 per ticket. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

OK, on it. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Issue ticket for only. will continue course with her trip to Riga. NO TRAIN for Only F 

On Mar 26, 2018, at 3:49 PM, Natalia Molotkova wrote: 

OK 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

lets wait on both just in case...I will get back to you 

On Mar 26, 2018, at 3:49 PM, Natalia Molotkova wrote: 

Issue for n Or wait. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationshi Mana er 
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Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

HOLD UP on ticket for We have her in Riga from April 3-6!!??? I need to ask Jeffrey what he wan 

On Mar 26, 2018, at 3:05 PM, Natalia Molotkova < > wrote: 

holds a passport from Belarus. (is this Russian? or is it Belarusian? Its not the same, right?) 
is

On Mar 26, 2018, at 3:22 PM, Natalia Molotkova wrote: 

Are they both Russian Citizens? 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

times are perfect. !! Please purchase 1st class for $412 round trip 

On Mar 26, 2018, at 3:05 PM, Natalia Molotkova wrote: 

03:31 PM LONDON ST-PANCRAS 06:47 PM PARIS NORD 2h 16m 136 Direct Eurostar 
Outbound 
2nd class - from $386.00 
1st class from $412.00 
Premier - from $704 
Return 
04:07 PM PARIS NORD 05:39 PM LONDON ST-PANCRAS 2h 32m 152 Direct - Premier $412.00 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Can you give me price tags for the 3 classes. Then I can make decision! Thanks. 9049 
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Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 26, 2018, at 2:47 PM, Natalia Molotkova wrote: 

Lesley, I forgot to ask, what class? Will need CID. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

ours: 'on roug rl•ay • • Y- 0PM EST 

On it. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

m 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Hi Natasha....) need train tickets for 
April 7 departing around 4pm. 

and from London to Paris via train on 7 
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