
To: 
Cc: 
From:  Tc carda 
Sent 
Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein-Donation 

Tue 4/10/2018 9:12:51 PM 

ok 
if not received by thursday please let me know and we will reissue 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

On Apr 10, 2018, at 5:05 PM, James Fitzpatrick <jpfitzp@hastypudding.org>
wrote: 

Hey Richard, 
I haven't received it yet. 

James 

On Tue, Apr 10, 2018 at 4:59 PM, Richard Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.com> wrote: 

james please confirm receipt of check from gratitude America 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 212-971-1306 
fax 212-320-0381 
cell 917-414-7584 
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> On Apr 6, 2018, at 2:58 PM, Lesley Groff <lesleyjec@gmail.com> wrote: 

> Hello James. Our accounting department will cut the check today for Jeffrey's 
donation...Can you please let me know where it should be sent and to who's 
attention? 

> Thank you, 
> Lesley 
> Assistant to Jeffrey Epstein 
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