
To: Richard Ka 
Cc: 
From: 
Sent Tue 4/10/2018 11:15:44 PM 
Subject• Re: Valeriya Planidina 

Tell Dr Kaplin Jeffrey doesn't know this person Valeriya. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Apr 10, 2018, at 6:23 PM, Richard Kahn < 

Ok thanks. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

> wrote: 

On Apr 10, 2018, at 6:06 PM, wrote: 

Jeffrey told me to ignore. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Apr 10, 2018, at 5:00 PM, Bebc Avdiu wrote: 

Hi 
Spoke to Dr. Kaplin's office today because they called 
looking for (at the STC office - weird) but it was 
regarding this email that he said he faxed to you a couple 
of days ago ( . I told them you were out 
this week and to fwd me whatever he needed JE to see 
and so he did. See below. I gave it to Rich and he is 
going to bring it to JE's attention when they go to the 
house tomorrow. 

Thanks! 

Bebe Avdiu 
Legal Assistant 
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC 
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573 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, New York 10022 

********************************************************* 

**************************** 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, 
and is intended only for the use of the addressee. 

It is the property of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 

and may be unlawful. If you haw received this communication in error, please notify us immediately 
by return e-mail, and destroy this communication 

and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 

Copyright of Darren K. Indykc, PLLC - O 2018 Darren K. Indykc, PLLC —
All rights reserved. 

********************************************************* 

**************************** 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Dr. Steven D. Kaplan D.M.D, Dr. 
Lisa Tran, D.M.D & Dr. Hannah Han 
D.D.S. M.S." 

Subject: Fwd: Valeriya Planidina 
Date: A ril 1 1 4:35:48 PM EDT 
To: 

 Forwarded message 
From: Valeriya Planidina 
Date: Wed, Apr 4, 2018 at 3:25 PM 
Subject: Re: Valeriya Planidina 
To: "Dr. Steven D. Kaplan D.M.D, Dr. Lisa Tran, D.M.D & Dr. 

Hannah Han D.D.S. M.S." 

Hello Dr.Steven, 
Yes, I do remember it was 5 years ago when I visited New York. 
You surprised me very much! 
Mr.Jeffrey Epstein took the responsibility to take care of all the bills 

and sended me to your clinic.. 
I would never have gone to such a high-class clinic myself especially in 
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New York..its a very expensive for me! I'm 
always knew that American medicine is very 
expensive in comparison with the Russian. 

I'm sorry but you must deal with Mr. Epstein. I do not know who 
agreed my visit with him at your clinic. 

I do not keep in touch with him for many years. 

Hopefully you can understand me. 

All the best, 
Valeriya 

On Wed, 4 Apr 2018 at 21:37, Dr. Steven D. Kaplan D.M.D, Dr. Lisa 
Tran, D.M.D & Dr. Hannah Han 
D.D.S.,M.S. ale> 
wrote: 

Hi Ms. Planidina, 
I hope all is well. I've been trying to get in 
touch with you over the years but to no 
avail. Hopefully you remember that Dr. 
Magnani sent you to me for a redo of your 
root canal on the upper left because you 
were in pain and the root canal was failing. I 
spent a lot of time treating the tooth and 
saved it. You told me Mr. Jeffrey Epstein 
was going to pay for your bill but when we 
sent it to him, be said that he wasn't 
involved and refused to pay. So I did the 
work and never got paid. The fee for the 
redo of the failed root canal was $2800. 
Can you please let me know how this will 
be paid? 

All the best, 

Steven D. Kaplan, D.M.D 

On Tue, Apr 3, 2018 at 11:42 AM, Valeri a Planidina 
wrote: 

Hello Dr. Steven Kaplan, 
You was looking for Valeriya Planidina. 

How I can help you? 

Best regards, 
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Valeriya 

Steven D. Kaplan, D.M.D 
Lisa D. Tran, D.M.D 
Hannah Han, D.D.S.,M.S. 
119 West 57th Street, Ste 700 
New York. NY 10019 

Steven D. Kaplan, D.M.D 
Lisa D. Tran, D.M.D 
Hannah Han, D.D.S.,M.S. 
119 West 57th Street, Ste 700 
N w Y rk NY 1 1 
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