
To: 
From: Natalia Molotkova 
Sent: Wed 5/2/2018 4:28:54 PM 
Subject: Norwegian flight from Ft Laud fa tomorrow? Please the ck now! 

Title: American Express ® 

Not canceling Air France fro now, correct? If we do now, we will have to follow rules, if flight 
cancelled due to strike, we can get refund. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

please issue ticket! 

On May 2, 2018, at 12:22 PM, Natalia Molotkova 

wrote:

I am getting (booked leg by leg, due to not showing as connection): 
1 DY 7042 E 03MAY Q FLL CPH 0900P 1210P 
1 D8 3552 W 04MAY F CPH BUD 0715P 0900P 
1ADT 1133.50 1133.50 

TOTAL FARE - USD 1133.50 
VALIDATING CARRIER - DY 

NO LOWER FARE DETERMINED. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

yes please..thanks 

• • Molotkova 
wrote: 
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Strange, not giving me this option on my end. May be due to second leg is like within Europe only, 
let me see if I can book it on my end. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

I went to Norwegian Air website...depart May 3 at 21:0 through Copenhagen 
Florida-Fort Lauderdale/Miami -
Copenhagen 
Thursday 3. May 2018 21:00 
Terminal: 3 
Flight DY7042 - LowFare 
Operated by Norwegian Air Shuttle 

Copenhagen - Budapest 
Friday 4. May 2018 19:15 
Terminal: 2 
Flight D83552 - LowFare 
Operated by Norwegian Air 
International 

1 Adult $1,142.20 

On May 2, 2018, at 12:00 PM, Natalia Molotkova 
rote: 

Thank you. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 
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Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

I am sending him an email and asking! 

On Ma 2 2018 at 11'58 AM Natalia Molotkova 
rote: 

I checked London, Madrid, Frankfurt, Amsterdam.. nothing. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

ok, sorry!! 
I don't know what he saw... 

On May 2, 2018, at 11:54 AM, Natalia Molotkova 
wrote: 

Not to Budapest. I am not sure where they going directly Norwegian, that it not how my system 
works, let me play with cities. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

He only said through Europe to me. Is there anything you see out of ft Laud tomorrow? 

Sent from my iPhone 

EFTA_R1_01016194 
EFTA02242591



On May 2, 2018, at 11:43 AM, Natalia Molotkova wrote: .1 . 

He didn't give them to me. Check and see if he was looking on wrong day perhaps? Maybe it only 
goes on certain days? 

Sent from my iPhone 

< I On May 2, 2018, at 11:42 AM, Natalia Molotkova wrote: 

Where is connection? 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

may I have flight details? I am not showing it. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Jeffrey wants us to get a flight ASAP for tomorrow. He wants this done. Can you check on 
the Norwegian Flight from FT Laud through Europe to Budapest for us? 

Sent from my iPhone 
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