To:  Natalia Molotkova

From: Lesley Groff

Sent: Mon 4/30/2018 3:.07:55 P

Subject: Re: Flight for Karyna anc (RS
9049

Sent from my iPhone

On Apr 30, 2018, at 11:06 AM, Natalia Molotkova _ wrote:

Lesley, email just 4 digits, without word CID.
Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager
Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

Please DO issue the tickets below...use points for the biz class (CID# XXXX) Thanks!

On Ail‘ 30, 2018, at 10:34 AM, Natalia Molotkova
rote:

Your response is required to complete this reservation. Prices and availability are subject to
change.

+» Total air reservation, including taxes and fees: $2316.12 or 231 612 American Express
Points and 20% back (points are nonreversible, will nee CID)

+ Qutbound:

Wed 09 May - American Airlines 1410 - Business - 3h 15m
Departing: New York La Guardia Airport, (LGA) at 8.00am
Arriving: Miami Airport, (MIA) at 11.15am

Wed 09 May - American Airlines 1391 - Business - 2h 42m
Departing: Miami Airport, (MIA) at 12.16pm
Arriving: Cyril E. King Airport, St. Thomas (STT) at 2.58pm

+ Mon-refundable, change - plus difference in fare.

* Inbound:
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Thu 10 May - JetBlue 5973 - Economy - 0h 36m
OPERATED BY CAPE AIR
Departing: Cyril E. King Airport, St. Thomas (STT)at4.11pm

Arriving: Luis Munoz Marin International Airport, San Juan (SJU) at 4.47pm

Thu 10 May - JetBlue 1804 - Economy - 3h 5Tm

Departing: Luis Munoz Marin International Airport, San Juan (SJU) at 6.30pm

Arriving: New York John F Kennedy Airport, (JFK) at 10.27pm
+ Mon-refundable, $150.00 change fee plus difference in fare.
Please reply to this email and provide your authorization to proceed.

Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

ok, thanks

On Apr 30, 2018, at 10:24 AM, Natalia Molotkova

Yes, we can, let me email you details.
Regards,
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager
Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

Can we use the points and get the 20% back in peoints for the biz seats?

On Apr 30, 2018, at 9:19 AM, Natalia Molotkova
T
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| have permission to buy Biz for both on the cutbound and coach for both on the return. (the
4:11pm flight) Thank you!

On Apr 30, 2018, at 9:19 AM, Natalia Molotkova
I, v rote:

ok, will get back to you.

On Apr 30, 2018, at 9:19 AM, Natalia Molotkova

There are no direct flights.
Coach:
AA 1410 G 09MAY LGA MIA 0B00A 1115A
AA 1391 G 0OMAY MIA STT 1216P 0258P
1 ADT 257.90
TOTAL FARE -USD 515.80 (business is 767.30 per ticket)
1 B6 /9K 5973 H 10MAY STT SJU 0411P 0447P
OPERATED BY CAPE AIR
1 BB 1804 U 10MAY SJU JFK 0B830P 1027P
1ADT 380.76
TOTAL FARE - USD 781.52

Business - no two seats in business at the time you mentioned.
Americans have one seat left at 346pm.
Regards,

Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager
Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

On it
Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager
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Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

Morning! We need round trip tickets for Karyna Shuliak and _ from NY (any
airport) to St. Thomas on May 9th morning return on May 10th around 4/5//6pm...direct if

possible. Give me pricing for first (biz?) and coach. Thanks!
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