To: ke Gro_

From: I
Sent: Tue 5/29/2018 5:00:43 PM
Subject: Re: |J Wire Instructions

yes, | will need to shuffle money in to that account from within Bankwell. ..
then do the wire. ..

On May 29, 2018, at 12:06 PM, lke Gl‘{)ﬁ"‘_ wrote:

Can you wire to |J group from Redhawk

From: Jason Milligan
Sent: Tuesday, May 29, 2018 12:05 PM
To: Ike Groff
Subject: 1J Wire Instructions

ke

5200,000 please. Thank you very much. Plan to repay within a few weeks.

Patriot Bank

16 River 5t,
Marwalk, CT 06850
I} Group LLC.
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