ro
From: ancy Jordan

Sent: Thur /31/2018 10:09:02 PM
Subject: Re: Mailbox Structure

i [
I'm sorry [ wasn®t around today and didn® look at my emails. Let me know if Donald has another time

I'hanks,

TRELTICY
g

On Thu, May 31, 2018 at 12:15 PM, | G -

Hi Nancy. Donald can start the project on Monday June 4th morning. Might you be around
today so Donald could stop by, sign the work order and get the 50% down check from you?
Donald 1s working on NC today and says he can stop over later. Let me know!

Sent from my iPhone

On May 30, 2018, at 11:05 AM, Nancy Jordan <pancycjordan(@gmail.com™> wrote:

Thanks Lesley!

On Wed, May 30, 2018 at 9:17 AM, || RGN o

Momming Nancy. I sent the work order to Donald. He says for the extra post,
anchoring in cement and labor with be $200 more. so $1175.00 for the entire
job! He will get back to me re when they can start the project. | will make sure
he signs the work order and we will need to issue the 50% deposit. I'll be in

touch. . .thanks. [ NN

On May 28, 2018, at 8:41 PM, Nancy Jordan (via Google Docs)

Mancy Jordan has attached the following document:

Mailbox Structure
-
Aftached is the work order for the mailboxes. Look it over 1o see if I've included everything. You

may want to ask for a new guote knowing that we will need an additional post
for signage. I'll be interested in knowing what the new quote is.

Thanks for everything!

MNancy
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