To:  Natalia Molotkoval |

From: Lesley Groff

Sent: Fri 6/1/2018 7:27.22 PM

Subject: Re: Tickets fc:r?ﬁ and [l

Please issue ticket below for [} departing 4:10pm from CDG

Sent from my iPhone

On Jun 1. 2018, at 12:58 PM. Natalia Molotkova *_:' Wrote:

Your response is required to complete this reservation. Prices and availability are subject to
change.

» Total air reservation, including taxes and fees: $247 40,

+ Ticket is non-refundable, changes are not permitted.

» Code share:JOON

+ Thu 07 Jun - Air France 1194 - Economy - 2h 35m

OPERATED BY JOON

Departing: Paris Charles de Gaulle Airport, (CDG) at 4.10pm

Arriving: Lisbon Portela Airport, (LIS) at 5.45pm

Please reply is email and provide your authorization to proceed.
Working on .

Regards,

Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

On it.
Regards,
Matalia (Matasha) Molotkova

Centurion Relationship Manager

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST

Hi Natasha...we need a one way, coach ticket for _ from Milan to Lisbon on
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June 5th departing around 11am

Then we need a one way coach ticket fﬂr- from Paris to Lisbon on June 7th. anytime
that is good price...

Please let me know options and price. thanks!
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