
To: 
Cc: 
From: Bella Klein 
Sent Thur 5/31/2018 10:34:29 AM 
Subject Re: so#71462 

Great 
Thank you, 
Bella 

On May 31, 2018, at 6:32 A wrote: 

That makes sense! 

Sent from my iPhone 

On May 30, 2018, at 10:17 PM, Larry otc: Mr 

I believe it's for the New Plane,,, Rear lavatory 
Plan D, LLC 
JE met with me at the plane today„ he took measurements of the sink 
in his bathroom 

Sent from my iPad 

On May 30, 2018, at 10:09 P wrote: 

Sending to Larry so I believe it is for LSJ. Larry, do you 
think the same? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On May 30, 2018, at 6:51 PM, Bella Klein ote: 

For what property is the faucet 

Thank you, 
Bella 

On May 30, 2018, at 5:39 PM, 1 > 
wrote. 
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All correct! 
Please do charge our card 
Can you provide a tracking 
number for package once you 
have one? 

Sent from my iPhone 

On May 30, 2018, at 5:09 PM, Dawn Waniewski 
ote: 

5/30/18 
Thank you for the 
order - please 
review to make 
sure 
all is correct and if 
so - please allow 
me to charge your 
card ending in the 
last four numbers 
4009 in the amount 
of 782.52. 

Thank ou - dawn 

Dawn Waniewski 
International Bath & Tile 
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