Fr
Sent: Fri 6/1/2018 2:46:00 PM
Subject: Re: Jeffrey Paying of Bebe Celebration!!
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Sent from my iPhone

On Jun 1. 2018, at 10:43 AM, Bebe Avdiu < wrote:

Thank you soooooo much!

Bebe Avdiu

Legal Assistant
DARREXN k. INDYKE, PLIL
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e information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, and is intended
only for the use of the addressee

It is the property of Darren K. Indyvke, PLLC, Unaothorized use, disclosure or copying of this commumication or any
part thereol is strictly prohibited

and may be unlawfil, 11 vou have received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by retumn e-
mail, and destroy this communication

and all copies thereof, including all attachments.

Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - © 2018 Darren K. Indyke, PLLC — All rights
reserved.
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On Jun 1, 2018, at 10:42 AM,
wrote:

Very!!
Sent from my iPhone

On Jun 1, 2018, at 10:41 AM, Bella Klein <bklein575( gmail com™> wrote:
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Great, very nice and generous.
Thank you,
Bella

Jeftrey has kindly said he will pay for the BEBE CELEBRATION
dinner on Wed June 6 at 5pm, Ocean Prime!!

https://www.ocean-prime .com/locations/new-vork-city/map-directions
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