From:
Sent: Thur 5/31/2018 8:00:03 PM
Subject: Re: so#71462

HI Dawn...did you have a tracking number for me as of yet?

On May 30, 2018, at 5:41 PM, Dawn Wanicwski < ||| R ot

thank you - will continue - and yes - I'll send you tracking number when available
dawn

On Wed, May 30, 2018 at 2:39 PH,_ wrote:

All correct!
Please do charge our card
Can you provide a tracking number for package once you have one?

Sent from my iPhone

On May 30, 2018, at 5:09 PM, Dawn Waniewski -_1-‘> wrote:

230718

Thank you for the order - please review to make sure
all 1s correct and if so - please allow me to charge your
card ending in the last four numbers 4009 in the amount
of 782.52.

Thank vou - dawn

Dawn Waniewski
International Bath & Tile
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Dawn Waniewski
International Bath & Tile
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