To: infisevacation@gmail.com]
From:
Sent: a 8 2:47:38 PM

Subject: Flight fr:r-

yes! ticket is processing...we put a rush on the exchange...$97.04 for the total change
Acroflot #2452 departing Moscow 7:40am arriving CDG 10:35am

will send ticket once [ receive...

On May 16, 2018, at 10:35 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacationf@gmail com> wrote:
did we nrganizc.ncw ticket?

please note
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