
To: Natalia Molotkova 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent: Mon 5/21/2018 6:25:50 PM 
Subject: Re: Reserve Hotel II Duca in Milan Italy June 2-5 

I love that you can confirm the car is AA due to friend!! 
Please DO proceed with this reservation as stated below! 

Sent from my iPhone 

On May 21, 2018, at 2:22 PM, Natalia Molotkova wrote:

OK, I can do TOYOTA YARIS HATCHBACK/SIMILAR (my friend lives in Italy and drives it). 
Pick-Up 
Firenze Downtown , FL5 
Sat, Jun 02, 12:00 PM 

Return 
Milano Railway , M9D 
Sun, Jun 03, 12:00 PM 

Your response is required to complete this reservation. Prices and availability are subject to 
change. 

• The estimated total for your reservation is $163.74, including the base rate, applicable 
taxes and fees, and 1 minimum paid days. 

Please reply to this email and provide your authorization to proceed 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Flours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

super! yes, they are staying at an Airbnb ...the address is: 

Address 

On Ma 21 2018 at 1:41 PM Natalia Molotkova 
< wrote: 
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Where in Florence they are staying? I want to find location for pick up closer. So far lowest 
rate is with Budget. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

On it. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

automatic , economy is fine. 

On Ma 21 2018 at 12:07 PM Natalia Molotkova 
wrote: 

What car size? Manual or automatic? 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Hmm. Say 12pm 

Sent from my iPhone 
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On May 21, 2018, at 11:42 AM, Natalia Molotkova 
wrote: 

OK, working on car, what pick up time? City pick up? What car type? Size? 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Flours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Please do reserve 2 rooms at the II Duca Hotel in Milan under and 
names June 2-6. 

On Ma 21 2018 at 11:08 AM Natalia Molotkova 
< wrote: 

ME MILAN IL DUCA 
PIAZZA DI LA REPUBLICA 13 
MILAN IT 20124 
AURA ROOM SINGLE USE - rate per room 
" 289.75 EFF 02JUN - 04JUN 

346.75 EFF 04JUN - 05JUN 
APPROX. TOTAL PRICE 926.25 EUR 
INCLUDES TAXES AND SURCHARGES 
Your response is required to complete this reservation. Prices and availability are subject to 
change. 
• Estimated total for hotel reservation: EUR1850.50. Daily resort fees may apply. 

Please reply to this email and provide your authorization to proceed. 
Cancellation 24 hours. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 
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Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

thanks 

Molotkova 
> wrote: 

On it. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Hi Natasha...can you plea swr rve the Hotel II Du In  Italy from June 2-5...let me 
know room rates...one for and one room for =...they will pay with their own CC 
but need to reserve... 

We need reserve a car in Florence on June 2 for =...they will drive to Milan...one 
day rental will use her own CC but we need to reserve. 
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