To:
From: ella Klein

Sent: Sat 5/26/2018 12:44:24 AM
Subject: Re: Amex charge for JE

Great, they are ready to ship! They didn’t have it a few weeks back and didn't
have a for it.

> yes, I submitted Jeffrey's email address ..account was just now set up

>
»» On May 25, 2018, at 7:46 FM, Bella Klein _ wrote:
e

Did JE redques subscription ? We cancelled same a few weeks
back as kit was not ready yet and they had no idea when it will be available.

»> Bella

>>> On May 25, 2018, at 1:35 PM, _Nmm:
»>»> Hi Bella.you will see an Amex charge for 539% Bi

is =some sort of kit being sent to JE through Deepak
it is a "micro biome kit"..not sure..but wanted wyou t
to Deepak’'s office.
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