
To: Good Tastes of Tuscany( 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent Sun 5/13/2018 9:43:00 PM 
Subject: Re: Villa Pandolfini 1 for May 26-June 2, 2018 

I just paid the deposit for and for your cooking course May 26-
June 2! Please let me know when the rest of the payment is due. thank you, Lesley 

On May 12, 2018, at 5:10 AM, Good Tastes of Tuscany 

M ff • wrote: 

Hi lesley, 
Yes I confirm holding Villa Pandolfini 1 for you. 

• 
Warm Regards, 
Sharmila. 

The team at Goodtastesoftuscany 
Accademia Italiana di Cucina Pandolfini- professional culinary school and Villa Pandolfini 

Estate 
A memorable Tuscan culinary experience for food lovers and professionals 
http://www.tuscany-cooking-class.com 

On 12 May 2018 at 00:14, Lesley Groff •ta wrote: 

I will pay for the classes and the villa on Monday May 14!! Please do continue to 
HOLD the villa. Thank you! Lesley 

Sent from my iPhone 

On May II, 2018, at 1:03 PM, Good Tastes of Tuscany 
wrote: 

Hi Lesley, 
Thank you for your enquiry. 

Yes you may go ahead and book the cooking vacation package for you both and 
upon booking, I shall hold the house for you, 

OR you can also book online from the below link making your payment 

www.tuscany-cooking-class.com/pay-online 

NOTE : In the reference section, pls note Lesley_Cooking Vacation Package _Villa 
Pandolfikni 1_2 pax. 
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also note extra 300 euro each if you prefer to have a private room. 

Do let me know if you have any other questions. 

Warm Regards, 
Sharmila. 

The team at Goodtastesoftuscany 
Accademia Italiana di Cucina Pandolfini- professional culinary school and Villa 

Pandolfmi Estate 
A memorable Tuscan culinary experience for food lovers and professionals 
httpa tpscany-cooking-class.com 

On 11 May 2018 at 22:13, Lesley Groff wrote: 

Hello...I would like to sign up 2 ladies for your 7 day Cooking 
Vacation in Italy and have them stay in your Villa Pandolfini I from 
May 26-June 2nd. I will register them for the course on line but 
when we try to book the Villa Pandolfini 1, it will not allow us. Can 
you please help? 

Thank you, 
Lesley 
Assistant to Jeffrey Epstein 
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