
To: Bella Klei 
From: a 
Sent Wed 5/16/2018 9:42:17 PM 
Subject Re: Amex Fekkai 

Blowout for 1M 

On May 16, 2018, at 12:24 PM, Bella Klein wrote:

Can you please email Fekkai. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

On May 16, 2018, at 12:22 PM, 
wrote: 

I don't know. I was on holiday. Jeffrey flew from NY to PB on April 12. 

Sent from my iPhonc 

On May 16, 2018, at 11:36 AM, Bella Klein •:~> wrote: 

Hi al 
Can you help with the charge below 

04/12/2018 FREDERIC FEKKAI - NEW 
YORK, NY 

Thank you, 
Bella 

109.73 
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