
To: Amex Centurian Trave 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent: 
Subject: Re: Flight for 

Tue 5/22/201.141, 

thank you! 

On Ma 22, 2018, at 4:33 PM, Natalia Molotkova 
wrote: 

Ok, sending itinerary. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

probably worth it! Lets reserve the nicer connection ...thanks 

On May 22, 2018, at 4:23 PM, Natalia Molotkova <  wrote: 

We can do return nice connection, fare is just $200 higher - $1746.21 
SK2788 08JUL SPU CPH 325P 540P 
SK 901 08JUL CPH EWR 635P 905P 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationshi Mana er 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

OK 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationshi Mana er 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Please HOLD the lower fare flight you found on SK....can you send in itinerary form so I can ask for approva 

On May 22, 2018, at 4:05 PM, Natalia Molotkova < wrote: 
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ok, thank you so much. 
that is a long connecting time, but she may have to do it! 
I will get back to you. 

On May 22, 2018, at 4:05 PM, Natalia Molotkova <  wrote: 

Itinerary you mentioned is $2762.81. 
1 AA 2146 Y 28JUN Q LGA BOS 0200P 0314P 
1 AA MB 8640 I 28JUN Q BOS MAD 0530P 0620A - business 
OPERATED BY IBERIA 
1 IB 3276 I 29JUN F MAD SPU 0800A 1040A 
2 AY 1842 L 08JUL S SPU HEL 0900A 1255P 
2 AY 5 L 08JUL S HEL JFK 0210P 0350P 

1ADT 2762.81 2762.81 
TOTAL FARE - USD 2762.81 

Lower fare is 
1 SK 910 V 28JUN Q EWR CPH 0535P 0715A 
1 SK 2831 V 29JUN F CPH SPU 0905A 1120A 

2 SK 
2 SK 

4840 V 08JUL S SPU OSL 1005P 1255A - long connecting time in Oslo 
907 V 09JUL M OSL EWR 1110A 0115P 

TOTAL FARE - USD 1513.81 
VALIDATING CARRIER - SK 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationshi Mana er 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

thanks! 

On May 22, 2018, at 2:34 PM, Natalia Molotkova c  wrote: 

OK, working on it. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relatio. Mana•er 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 
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We need to revisit this trip...She really does not need to go to Rome...she was only doing so to break up the 
not been...She needs to get from NY to Split with least amount of layovers. She needs to be in Split by June 
do you get for: 
Thurs. June 28 AA from LGA at 2pm through BOS, then MAD and arriving SPU at 10:40am 

Sun. July 8 Finnair depart SPU at 9am through HEL arriving JFK at 3:50pm 

or let me know if you see something with OK stops and pricing. thanks! 

On May 18, 2018, at 2:35 PM, Natalia Molotkova < wrote: 

;) thanks 
I will come back to you. 

On May 18, 2018, at 4:21 PM, Natalia Molotkova ea. wrote: 

Yes, sorry, added extra 1 - $1759.71 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relatio. i. Mana er 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

I think the total fare on thing 2 has a typo.... 

On May 18, 2018, at 3:56 PM, Natalia Molotkova e > wrote: 

Thing one: 
Lowest fare on the market will be Aeroflot via Moscow (not good connecting time) 
1 SU 103 25JUN JFK SVO 0710P 1120A 
1 SU 2046 26JUN SVO SPU 0450P 0705P 

2 SU 
2 SU 

2047 08JUL SPU SVO 0815P 1215A 
100 09JUL SVO JFK 0920A 1205P 

TOTAL FARE - USD 1636.01 
Or Iberia 
1 IB 6250 25JUN JFK MAD 0515P 0630A 
1 IB 3230 26JUN MAD FCO 0850A 1120A 
1 IB /VY 5460 26JUN FCO SPU 0235P 0345P 
OPERATED BY VUELING AIRLINES S.A. 
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2 IB 3277 08JUL SPU MAD 1210P 0300P 
2 IB 6253 08JUL MAD JFK 0410P 0630P 

TOTAL FARE - USD 1926.81 PRIVATE 

Thing two - lower fare will be 
1 SU 103 25JUN JFK SVO 0710P 1120A 
1 SU /AZ 4369 26JUN SVO FCO 0440P 0735P 
OPERATED BY ALITALIA S.P.A. IN A.S 

2 IB NY 5460 29JUN FCO SPU 0950A 1100A 
OPERATED BY VUELING AIRLINES S.A. 

3 SU 
3 SU 

2047 08JUL SPU SVO 0815P 1215A 
100 09JUL SVO JFK 0920A 1205P 

TOTAL FARE - USD 11759.71 
Fare can't be guaranteed till ticket is issued. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relatio  Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

2 things... 
1. Can you give me a price with out the stop to Rome?....(just NY-Croatia-NY June 25 return July 8) 
2. Jeffrey is asking if there is a cheaper price for the trip she is requesting...NY-Rome-Croatia-NY same date 

On May 18, 2018, at 2:35 PM, Natalia Molotkova e > wrote: 

ok, thank you! 
I will get back to you. 

On May 18, 2018, at 2:35 PM, Natalia Molotkova e > wrote: 

Most direct will be: One World airlines 
1 BA /M 1585 25JUN JFK FCO 0500P 0715A 
OPERATED BY AMERICAN AIRLINES INC. 
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2 IB NY 5460 29JUN FCO SPU 0950A 1100A 
OPERATED BY VUELING AIRLINES S.A. 

3 IB 3277 08JUL SPU MAD 1210P 0300P 
3 IB 6253 08JUL MAD JFK 0410P 0630P 

TOTAL FARE - USD 2200.01 
Pretty much same fare on June 26th. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

On it. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationshi. Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Hi Natasha...we need a multi trip, coach ticket for as below: 

Depart June 25 or 26 (which ever day is least expensive) from any NY airport to Rome, Italy 

Depart June 29 from Rome to Split Croatia 

Return on July 8 from Split Croatia back to NY (any airport) 

Bday is 
She is 
She is XXXXXXXXXX so I do not have al. or 

Lesley 

for you...do you need this info 

Pr3vacv Statement, I Visit the Centunon Card website 
To learn more about s-mail security or report a suspkious e-mail, please visit us at srenct-c,prrhh :/r— ph "Ph 
40 2015 American Express. All rights reserved 
American Express uses 3rd party concierge service providers who are not authorized to act on behalf of American Express and you acknowledge that Amen 
way responsible or liable for the actions of the service provider and the only remedy for any claims relating to services or products provided by the service pr 
service provider and not against American Express. You are responsible for any purchases, shipping charges andror fees you authorize. We reserve the rig h 
preference data for servicing purposes. 

EFTA_R1_01027559 
EFTA02247760


