
To: Amex Centurian Trave 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent: Fri 6/8/2018 M
Subject: Re: Ticket for 

aim

super, thanks 

On Jun 8, 2018, at 1:59 PM, Natalia Molotkova 

'c > wrote: 

Ticket is on its way. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

confirming you are to issue below refundable ticket... 

On Jun 8, 2018, at 1:56 PM, Natalia Molotkova ‹ > wrote: 

Your response is required to complete this reservation. Prices and availability are subject to change. 
• Total air reservation, including taxes and fees: $1068.72. 
• Ticket is refundable; changes are subject to difference in fare. 

• Fri 22 Jun - - Economy - 4h 5m 
Departing: Moscow Sheremetyevo Airport, (SVO) at 
Arriving: Paris Charles de Gaulle Airport, (CDG) at 

Mon 25 Jun - - Economy - 3h 45m 
Departing: Paris Charles de Gaulle Airport, (COG) at
Arriving: Moscow Sheremetyevo Airport, (SVO) at 

Please reply to this email and provide your authorization to proceed. 

Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Hi Natasha...Jeffrey would like to issue the below...do refundable please! 
OPTION 1 
1 
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2 
refundable - $1068.72 

On Jun 8, 2018, at 12:28 PM, Natalia Molotkova < wrote: 

ok, I will get back to you! 

On Jun 8, 2018, at 12:28 PM, Natalia Molotkova <a wrote: 

Yes 

2
1I 

Non-refundable fare - $904.72, refundable - $1068.72. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 
natalia.molotkova centurion.com 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

is it possible for her to arrive earlier on June 22? say around noon? 

On Jun 8, 2018, at 12:08 PM, Natalia Molotkova <  wrote: 

Lowest non refundable 
1 In 
2 

TOTAL FARE - USD 849.72 
Refundable 
1 
2 
OPERATED BY AEROFLOT/AEROFLOT RUSSIAN AIRLINES, PJSC 

TOTAL FARE - USD 962.06 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relati.. Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

OK 
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Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 
Centurion Relationship Manager 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

I had name incorrectly spelled in the subject line before! She has in her name... 

On Jun 8, 2018, at 10:40 AM, Natalia Molotkova c  wrote: 

On it. 
Regards, 
Natalia (Natasha) Molotkova 

Hours: Mon through Friday 9AM-530PM EST 

Hi Natasha...we need a round trip, coach ticket for from Moscow to Paris on June 22 returr 
please...give me price on fully refundable/changeable as well as non refundable ...thanks! 

Russian 

Birthday: 
P Expires: 
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