
To: 
From: 
Sent Mon • 33 AM 
Subject: Re: rip 

ok, thanks 
> On May 20, 2018, at 8:19 PM, Bella Klein wrote: 

> Yes, I have their bank details, but they need to collect all receipts and after 
email for reimbursement 

> Thank you, 

> Bella 

» On May 20, 2018, at 7:56 PM, wrote: 

» Hi Bella...do you have bank details? you are going to need to 
wire them money for this trip they are taking to Italy... 
>> 
» -hotel stay for '49 Euros for one night plus tax (May 22) 
>> 
» -car rental for for $40.43 plus taxes for one day (May 23/24) 

>> they will be renting another car and staying in another hotel as well...I will 
get back to you on that! 
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