
To: Bella Klei mj 
From: Lesley Grl 
Sent Fri 6/22/2018 2:59:22 PM 
Subject Re: Merchant Credit 

Yes. We had to cancel the Bach family tickets and repurchase for July 4 departure. They had 
originally requested July 5 departure. It is always a huge chore with them and their flights. 
Thanks. 

Scnt from my iPhone 

On Jun 22, 2018, at 10:32 AM, Bella Klein > wrote: 

fYi 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "American Express" 
<AmericanExpresswelcome.aexo.com>
Subject: Merchant Credit 
Date: June 22, 2018 at 10:29:22 AM EDT 
To: <ap@hbrkassociates.com>
Reply-To: "" <AmericanExoress@welcome.aexp.com>

Hello, JEFFREY E EPSTEIN Centurionx Card 
Ending: 14009 
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Merchant credits were received 

Jun 21, 2018 

Jun 21, 2018 

Jun 21, 2018 

Jun 21, 2018 

DEUTSCHE 
LUFTHANSA AG 

DEUTSCHE 
LUFTHANSA AG 

DEUTSCHE 
LUFTHANSA AG 

DEUTSCHE 
LUFTHANSA AG 

-$3334.11 

-$3334.11 

-$4012.91 

-$4258.91 

View Account Details Online 

—7-21 For your most up to date 
account information visit us 

at 
AmericanExpress.com 

privacy Statement 

Was this email helpful? 

L_ 

To stop this alert, simply click here. 

Update Your Email 

Your Card Member information is included above to help you recognize this as a customer service e-ma, 
from American Express. To learn more about e-mail security or report a suspicious e-mait, please visit 

us at saksomastitsangshishing. We kindly ask you not to reply to this e-mail but instead contact us 
via Customer Care. 

tri 2018 American Express. All rights reserved. 
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